
Heat 1
LOT TRAP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RESERVEBID SOLD Y/N
1 1 Slaneyside Frend 3.51 Evaw Ldnrl €2,200 Yes
2 3 Dahungryhorse 3.39 Faw Hdnrl €950 Yes
4 5 Westwind  Sonny  3.74 MsdBk Rnon €400 Yes
Results 1,3,5 Distances 1,6 Time 29.5
Heat 2
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
7 2 Slaneyside Amber 3.49 KO2 Fin €1,200 €750 No 
8 4 Jumping John 3.44 CrdRu Finwll €5,000 €1,800 No 
6 6 Ronnies Dina 3.51 Slaw Rnon €500 Yes
Results 4,6,2 Distances 2, Dis Time 29.57
Heat 3
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
9 1 Kanturk Wild 3.49 Slaw NvShw €200 Yes
10 3 Westwind Walk 3.41 Evaw Rnon €1,000 Yes
11 5 Camp Holly 3.42 Slaw Rnon €2,000 €1,000 No 
Results 5,3,1 Distances 3.50,5 Time 29.46
Heat 4
Lot TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
12 2 Solid Dakota 3.47 Evaw Blk1 €400 Yes
13 4 Overpaid 3.63 Slaw Clru €1,200 €550 No 
14 6 Miss Mini Charm 3.48 Bl1 Finwll €1,500 €800 No 
Results 6,4,2 Distances 1,3.50 Time 29.77
Heat 5
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
16 1 Westwind Jen 3.41 Evaw Rnon €1,500 €700 No 
17 3 Dashgrove  Noelle 3.33 LdRu Finwll €4,000 €2,200 No 
15 5 Ronnies Tipples 3.47 Slaw Clrn €550 Yes
Results 3,1,5 Distances 5.50,2 Time 29.18
Heat 6
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
19 2 Happy Together 3.49 Ld1  Finwll €1,050 Yes
20 4 Kilmoney Peg 3.46 Evaw Nvshwd No Bid No 
18 6 Confident  Fiona 3.47 Slaw Clrn €850 Yes
Results 2,6,4 Distances 2,12 Time 29.41
Heat 7
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
21 1 Lulus Delight 3.4 Evaw Finwll €1,000 €650 No 
23 3 Drive on Striker 3.34 Faw Hldon €2,000 €450 No 
22 5 Great Invention 3.56 Slaw Rnon €300 Yes
Results 3,1,5 Distances 1,3 Time 29.59
Heat 8
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
24 2 Murdaniel Flyer 3.41 Wru NvShw No Bid No 
25 4 Ridgedale Jack 3.47 Blk1  Finwll €2,600 Yes
26 6 No Filter 3.5 Blk1 Rnon €1,500 Yes
Results 4,6,2 Distances 3,10 Time 29.4
Heat 9
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
27 1 Fantastic  Voyage 3.44 Bmpru Rnon €3,000 €1,500 No 
28 3 Donegal Emma 3.57 Slaw Nvshw €200 Yes
29 5 Coppeen Machine 3.46 Blkru Finwll €4,000 €2,700 No 
Results 5,1,3 Distances 2,7 Time 29.21
Heat 10
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
30 2 Milagro 3.53 Slaw Nvshw €450 Yes



31 4 Lasting Memory 3.53 Blk1 Finwll €800 Yes
32 6 Glenduff Savvi 3.46 BMp1 Rnon €750 Yes
Results 4,6,2 Distances 1,3.50 Time 29.43
Heat 11
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
33 1 Blastoff Milky  3.52 Evaw Nvshw No Put UpNo 
34 3 Vale Patc 3.44 Faw Ald €3,000 Yes
35 5 Daleroad Odyssey 3.53 Crd1 Rnon €900 Yes
Results 3,5,1 Distances 10,6 Time 29.07
Heat 12
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
36 2 Nelliesos Son 3.43 Evaw  Bmp2 €800 €300 No 
37 4 Riverdale Trudy  3.39 Faw  Finwll €650 Yes
39 6 Blackwood Coco 3.48 Slaw Bmp2 €1,500 €650 No 
Results 4,6,2 Distances 5,5 Time 29.27
Heat 13
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
40 1 Blastoff Una 3.56 Evaw Nvshw No Bid No 
42 3 Dance Jaco 3.6 Slaw Ldnrl €3,500 €2,100 No 
41 5 Parkgate Getaway  3.42 Faw Hdnrl €900 Yes
Results 3,5,1 Distances nk,12 Time 29.17
Heat 14
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
43 2 Granard Thunder 3.42 Evaw Rnon €1,000 Yes
44 4 Ranchers Gin  Gee 3.28 Faw OutP €1,000 Yes
46 6 Riverdale Rosa 3.41 Evaw Clrn €850 Yes
Results 6,2,4 Distances 1,0.50 Time 29.09
Heat 15
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
47 3 Ballydorgan Wasp 3.39 Faw Hdnrl No Bid No 
48 5 Glynnscross  Flora 3.46 Evaw  Ldnrl €150 Yes

Results 5,3 Distances Nk Time 29.59
Heat 16
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
50 2 Ranchers Trick 3.26 Faw OutP No Bid No 
49 4 Killaheen Mac 3.33 Chl3 Finwll . €1,300 Yes
. . . . . . .
Results 4,2 Distances 2 Time 28.45
Heat 17
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
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Heat 18
LOT TP Greyhound Name SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
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Heat 19
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
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Heat 20
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
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Heat 21
LOT TP GREYHOUND NAME SPLIT REMARKS RES BID SOLD Y/N
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